



## BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE

### DECLARATION OF LOWEST CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE QUOTATION AND RECOMMENDING AWARD OF CONTRACT

(Resolution No. 2024-019)

**WHEREAS**, Purchase Request No. 202401006 (Annex A) was received on 24 January 2024 for the **Subscription to Various Online Applications for Learning and Development ("Project")** with approved budget for the contract in the amount of **Nine Hundred Ninety-Five Thousand Pesos (Php 995,000.00)**;

**WHEREAS**, Request for Quotation No. 2024-002 was posted in PhilGEPS on 18 January 2024 for the abovementioned procurement (Annex B is proof). The same RFQ was posted in Securities and Exchange Commission (SEC) website and/or in conspicuous place inside the premises of SEC on same date;

**WHEREAS**, in compliance with Republic Act No. 9184 and its implementing rules and regulations, the Bids and Awards Committee Secretariat, on 18 January 2024, invited (Annex C is proof) the legally, technically, and financially capable suppliers/contractors;

**WHEREAS**, the Project, having several items which shall be awarded as separate contracts per item, is composed of the following:

Item No.	Description	ABC
1	Portable Document Format Editor Software	₱368,000.00
2	Online Mockup Styling Application	₱67,000.00
3	Online multi-level workflow approval	₱31,000.00
4	Grammar, spelling, and plagiarism checking software	₱141,400.00
5	URK Shortener and QR Code Generator Software	₱192,000.00
6	Online Graphic Design Platform	₱90,100.00
7	Online Question and Answer, and Polling Platform	₱55,000.00
8	Collaborative Web Platform for Trainings and Meetings	₱26,000.00
9	Online Automated Certificate Generator for Trainings and Events	₱23,600.00

**WHEREAS**, upon determination that changes should be effected in the technical specifications, items 1, 2, and 6 were cancelled;

**WHEREAS**, on or before the deadline to submit quotations- i.e., 23 January 2024, 10AM – the following quotations were received and opened (Annex D is Abstract of Quotation):

Name	Item No.	Quotation	Remarks
<i>Ynzal Marketing Corporation</i>	3	<i>no bid</i>	<i>Accepted</i>
	4	₱127,400.00	<i>Accepted</i>
	5	₱188,000.00	<i>Accepted</i>
	7	₱51,600.00	<i>Accepted</i>
	8	<i>no bid</i>	
	9	₱21,800.00	<i>Accepted</i>
<b>Total</b>		<b>₱388,800.00</b>	
<i>Datacore Technologies Inc.</i>	3	₱28,000.00	<i>Accepted</i>
	4	₱105,000.00	<i>Accepted</i>
	5	<i>no bid</i>	
	7	<i>no bid</i>	
	8	<i>no bid</i>	
	9	₱18,000.00	<i>Accepted</i>
<b>Total</b>		<b>₱151,000.00</b>	

*MW*

**WHEREAS**, after verification and validation of all accepted proposals on 01 February 2024 (Annex E are the Evaluation Reports), it was determined that:

1. the quotations of Ynzal Marketing Corporation for items 5 and 7 with a total bid of **Two Hundred Thirty-Nine Thousand Six Hundred Pesos (P239,600.00)** were the lowest calculated and responsive quotations for the said items; and
2. the quotations of Datacore Technologies Inc. for Items 3, 4 and 9 with a total bid of **One Hundred Fifty-One Thousand Pesos (P151,000.00)** were the lowest calculated and responsive quotations for the said items.

**NOW, THEREFORE**, we, the members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby resolve to declare the quotations of **Ynzal Marketing Corporation** in the amount of **Two Hundred Thirty-Nine Thousand Six Hundred Pesos (P239,600.00)** for items 5 and 7 and the quotations of **Datacore Technologies Inc.** in the amount of **One Hundred Fifty-One Thousand Pesos (P151,000.00)** for items 3, 4, and 9 as the lowest calculated and responsive quotations for the **Subscription to Various Online Applications for Learning and Development**, and to recommend to the Head of the Procuring Entity the award of contract to the said bidders in accordance with the terms and conditions of the Request for Quotation No. 2024-002 and accepted quotations.

RESOLVED this 5<sup>th</sup> day of February 2024 at The SEC Headquarters, 7907 Makati Avenue, Salcedo Village, Bel-Air, Makati City, Philippines.

  
**OLIVER O. LEONARDO**  
*Vice-Chairman*

  
**DAISY B. PABUYA**  
*Member*

  
**MARLON LESTER M. CANTOR**  
*Provisional Member*

  
**LESTER PAUL N. OBON**  
*Provisional Member*

  
**ARMANDO A. PAN, JR.**  
*Chairman*

Approved / Disapproved:

**Filbert Catalino F. Flores III**  
*Head of the Procuring Entity /*  
*Authorized Representative*  
Date: \_\_\_\_\_  
*/cdc*